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Statement of Licensing Policy 
The Statement of Licensing Policy lays down a general approach to the 
determination of licensing applications and any such application will be 
considered on its individual merits. 
  
Equally, any person permitted by the Act to make relevant representations to 
the Committee will have those representations considered on their individual 
merit. 
 
The Committee should consider the fundamental principles set out in its own 
policy, particularly paragraphs 6.7,6.8 and 6.9 which are reproduced below: 
 
6.7. Where a representation proceeds to a hearing the Hearings Regulations 
allow for further information to be put forward in support of that representation.  
However, that material must only relate to the initial representation and must  
not add new grounds of objection. It is therefore vitally important that as much  
detail and evidence as possible is included at the time the representation is  
made. Representations made without supporting detail and evidence may be  
viewed as frivolous or vexatious and disregarded. 
 
6.8. It is for the Licensing Authority to determine whether any representation 
by an interested party is, on its own merits, vexatious or frivolous. The Authority 
will determine this and make the decision on the basis of what might ordinarily 
be considered to be vexatious or frivolous. 
 
6.9. Where representations are received the characteristics of an area and the  
impact that the premises may have upon that area will be a fundamental  
consideration in determining whether a licence should be granted and if so  
what conditions should be attached to it. Conditions will be focused on  
matters that are within the control of individual licensees and others in  
possession of relevant Authorisations. 
  
These matters will centre on the premises being used for licensable activities 
and the vicinity of those premises. What amounts to the “vicinity” will be a 
question of fact to be determined in the light of the individual circumstances of 
the case.  
 
Consideration will primarily be given to the direct impact of the licensed  
activity on those who live, work or are engaged in business or other activities  
in the area concerned. 
 
4.7 Whether or not incidents can be regarded as being “in the vicinity” of 
licensed premises is a question of fact and will depend on the particular 
circumstances of the case. In cases of dispute, the question will ultimately be 
decided by the courts. In addressing this matter, the Licensing Authority will 
primarily focus on the direct impact of the activities taking place at the licensed 
premises on members of the public living, working or engaged in  
normal activity in the area concerned. 
  
4.8 Licensing law is not the primary mechanism for the general control of 
nuisance and anti-social behaviour by individuals once they are away from the 
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licensed premises and, therefore, beyond the direct control of the individual, 
club or business holding the licence, certificate or authorisation concerned. 
Nonetheless, it is a key aspect of such control and licensing law will always be 
part of the overall approach to the management of the evening and night-time 
economy in town and city centres.  
 
The Committee should also have regard to paragraphs 7.1 to 7.5 in relation to 
such circumstances where it may be appropriate to consider the imposition of 
conditions on a premises licence. 

 


